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Trisept Solutions Adds New Supplier to VAX VacationAccess 

Luxury tour provider Maupintour featured on award-winning leisure travel marketplace 
 

Milwaukee (April 6, 2016) – Trisept Solutions, a leading-edge travel technology firm propelling the 
biggest names in travel, announces the launch of luxury tour provider Maupintour on VAX 
VacationAccess. 
 
Vacation tour offerings by the Weston, Fla. based Maupintour – a subsidiary of Monaker Group (OTCQB: 
MKGI) – will be featured on VAX through a supplier showcase, select advertising and educational 
webinars.  
 
“We’re incredibly excited to have Maupintour join our line-up of suppliers on VAX,” said Lynn Clark, vice 
president of travel agency engagement. “Their products will undoubtedly broaden the offering on VAX, 
giving travel agents even more benefits and value when using the platform.” 
 
Maupintour offers private tours for individuals in Africa, Asia, Australia, Central and South America, 
Europe and North America. 
 
“Working with Trisept and VAX will help us reintroduce Maupintour to travel agents on the industry’s 
most trusted booking platform,” said Bill Kerby, chairman and CEO of Monaker Group. “With over 30 
years of experience, I’m confident that our concierge-level service will help travel agents build more 
robust and custom itineraries for their clients.” 
 
VAX is used by over 70,000 travel agents on a regular basis and provides an intuitive and user-friendly 
way for agents to research, market and sell custom vacations. It was voted “Best Agent-Only Website for 
Online Travel Services” by Travel Weekly’s Magellan Awards and continues to evolve as a superior tool 
for leisure travel professionals.  
 
Visit www.vaxvacationaccess.com for more information. 

About VAX VacationAccess® 
VAX VacationAccess is propelled by Trisept Solutions, a provider of innovative technology solutions for 
the travel industry. VAX provides over 70,000 leisure travel professionals with free access to Research, 
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Market and Sell the leisure travel industry's leading agent-friendly suppliers on one easy to use platform. 
VAX VacationAccess is committed to their success, providing comprehensive access to relevant 
information, industry leading suppliers and tools to grow their business. VAX VacationAccess was voted 
a category winner by Travel Weekly's Magellan Awards as well as 2016 Best Travel Technology Provider 
and 2016 Best Travel Agent Reservation System by travAlliancemedia’s Travvy Awards. 

About Trisept Solutions 
Trisept Solutions was formed in 2000 with a team that leveraged more than 15 years of thought 
leadership, development, and operational excellence in the field of leisure travel technology. Trisept 
Solutions was first to master the concept of dynamic travel packaging in the electronic world, and today 
serves airlines, hotel companies, resorts, tour operators, travel agencies, tourist bureaus, airline 
alliances, theme parks, travel agencies and other suppliers. Headquartered in Milwaukee, Wisconsin, 
with an office in Dallas, Texas, the company employs a committed team of 145 professionals. For more 
information on Trisept Solutions, visit www.triseptsolutions.com 
 

### 
 

http://www.triseptsolutions.com/

